
 

1,000 Zika cases in Honduras since
December: minister
28 January 2016

Honduras has registered 1,000 cases of the
mosquito-borne Zika virus since December, which
has been linked to a rise in birth defects in Brazil,
Deputy Health Minister Francis Contreras said
Wednesday. 

Although Contreras did not mention any cases of
infants born with microcephaly, or abnormally small
heads, he did say that an elderly man may have
died after contracting the virus.

Between January 1 and Wednesday, 949 Zika
cases were reported, with authorities being alerted
to 51 other cases in December, Contreras told
reporters.

Health officials have also reported Zika patients
developing Guillain-Barre syndrome, a neurological
disorder that can cause paralysis or even death.

An elderly male patient at the Tegucigalpa
University Hospital School died after contracting
Zika, Contreras said.

"The elderly man had Guillain-Barre syndrome...
but we suspect that he had this before he was
affected by Zika," Contreras said.

Zika causes flu-like symptoms and a rash, and is
so mild that it goes undetected in 70 to 80 percent
of cases.

There is currently no specific treatment for Zika
and no way to prevent it other than avoiding
mosquito bites.

Zika originated in Africa and also exists in Asia and
the Pacific, but has not been associated with
microcephaly there. It first came to prominence in
Brazil in October.

Zika has spread to some 20 countries in Latin
America and the World Health Organization (WHO)
expects it to spread to every country in the

Americas except Canada and Chile.

The WHO says no definitive link between Zika and
fetal brain damage has been proven, but its director
general Margaret Chan called the possibility
"extremely worrisome." 
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